
 
Appendix 7 Proposed Scrutiny Workplan 

 

1st February 
2022 

23rd March 
2022 

June 22 September 22 November 
2022 

February 23 

Partner = 
Community Safety 
Priority 1 of the 

SBPS Safer 
Neighbourhoods  
Specific Scrutiny 
Question 

Crime against the 
elderly and 
vulnerable is an 

area that is tackled 
under this propriety. 
Can you let us know 
the action you take, 

and demonstrate 
the effectiveness of 
this, including any 
return on 

investment as 
benefitted by the 
broader society? 

Partner = Police 
End of Year 
Performance, and 

Plans for the year 
ahead 
Specific Scrutiny 
Question 

Considering the 
performance of the 
previous roll ing 12 

months, what are you 
plans for the year 
ahead, to tackle any 
areas where 

performance is seen 
to be in decline.  

Partner = Early 
Intervention and 
Family Support  

Priority 2 Reducing 
Violence Against 
Women and Girls 
Specific Scrutiny 

Question 
One of your aims was 
to produce  

communication 
strategy to increase 
awareness of the 
provision of services 

that deal with  
Violence Against 
Women & Girls. Please 
can you describe the 

strategy, and explain 
how you evaluate its 
effectiveness? 

 

Partner = Probation 
 Priority 3 Keeping  
Young People Safe 

Specific Scrutiny 
Question 
One of the aims within 
the plan is to reduce 

reoffending by 
working closely with 
YOS partners. Can you 

outline your 
partnership work with 
YOS, and explain how 
you determine its 

effectiveness? 
 

Partner = Assistant 
Director for Children's 
Social Care, Education, 

Care & Health Services  
 Priority 3 Keeping  
Young People Safe 
Specific Scrutiny 

Question 
Child exploitation is a 
priority for the London 

Borough of Bromley 
Safeguarding 
Partnership, can you 
tell  us the extent of 

the problem in this 
borough,  the 
measures you take, 
and how you measure 

success in this area? 

Partner = HOS Trading 
Standards and 
Commercial 

Regulation 
 Priority 4 Standing 
Together Against Hate 
and Extremism 

Specific Scrutiny 
Question 
The Council has 

Channel and Prevent 
Duties. Can you 
explain: 
1. how these duties 

fall  under this priority,  
2 what these duties 
are, and 3. how you 
can assess the 

effectiveness of these  

 


